
Bid Tabulation 

ITB 45-21 "Fresh Bread & Rolls"

Ericka Andrew, Buyer

Email: andrewe@jccal.org 

1 2
 Flower's Baking 

Co. of Birmingham 

LLC 

 Flower's Baking Co. of Birmingham LLC - 

"Negotiated Pricing" 

127.34$                   88.54$                                                                        

Line No. Description Product No. Packaging
Minimum 

Quantity
Price Negotiated Pricing

1 20 OZ. LOAF BREAD, LOAF-KING, WHITE, 

SOFT, SANDWICH SLICED, 24 USABLE SLICES 

10110380    

10810380   

61110383

24 ounce, 26 usable 

slices loaf
7

2.31$                       2.29$                                                                          

2
LOAF BREAD, HONEY WHEAT, LITE,                     

40- CALS/SLICE
12615040 loaf 10

2.99$                       2.97$                                                                          

3
20 OZ. LOAF BREAD, WHITE, OLD FASHIONED, 

ROUND TOP
61110160 loaf 8

2.31$                       2.29$                                                                          

4 16 OZ. LOAF BREAD, RAISIN 64499560 loaf 15 4.58$                       4.57$                                                                          

5 20 OZ LOAF BREAD, WHITE NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

6
20 OZ LOAF BREAD, WHITE BUTTER CRUST 

OLD FASHION
10215200 loaf 8

2.68$                       2.60$                                                                          

7
20 OZ LOAF BREAD, WHEAT SANDWICH 

SLICED
10215260 round top loaf 8

2.68$                       2.60$                                                                          

8
16 OZ LOAF BREAD, LITE WHEAT, 40 

CAL/SLICE
1021561

life 40 calories 

breads, sugar free
10

2.99$                       2.97$                                                                          

9 BBQ BREAD, SLICED LOAF
61115700   

10015700
unsliced loaf 6

2.61$                       2.60$                                                                          

10 TEXAS TOAST, SLICED LOAF 10040100 loaf 7 2.68$                       2.65$                                                                          

11 20 OZ LOAF BREAD, WHITEWHEAT 13410170 loaf 8 2.68$                       2.60$                                                                          

12 HONEY WHEAT BREAD 10215080 loaf 8 2.68$                       2.60$                                                                          

13
24 OZ. WHOLE GRAIN SANDWICH LOAF – 51% 

WHOLE GRAIN
13740590 loaf 7

2.31$                       2.29$                                                                          

14 K-12 SPEC WHITE SANDWICH 26.5 OZ. 95933410 loaf 7 2.31$                       2.29$                                                                          

15 K-12 SPEC WHEAT SANDWICH 26.5 OZ. 95933420 loaf 7 2.31$                       2.29$                                                                          

38.12$                     37.61$                                                                        

Grand Total

(Loaf Bread) Group I Total:

Loaf Bread - Group I
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Line No. Description Product No. Packaging
Minimum 

Quantity
Price Negotiated Pricing

1 BROWN AND SERVE (12 PACK) NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

2
(24 COUNT) WHOLE WHEAT DINNER ROLLS 

10024550 24-pack 5
3.65$                       3.60$                                                                          

3
LUNCHEON (CHIC ROLLS – FULLY BAKED,                  

24 PACK)
10029102 24-pack 5

3.65$                       3.60$                                                                          

4
12 OZ. BUTTERBREAD DINNER ROLLS                    

(12 COUNT)
10236742 12-pack 7

2.83$                       2.80$                                                                          

5
16 OZ. SWEET DINNER ROLL (HAWAII STYLE) 

12-COUNT NO BID NO BID NO BID
-$                        -$                                                                           

6 SUB ROLL WHITE 6” UNSLICED – (6-COUNT) 10320960 6-pack 9
2.83$                       2.80$                                                                          

7
SUB ROLL WHEAT 6” UNSLICED –                              

(6-COUNT) NO BID NO BID NO BID
-$                        -$                                                                           

8
15 OZ. PHILLY STYLE HOAGIE ROLLS WITH 

SEEDS (6-COUNT)
10393650 6-pack 9

2.83$                       2.80$                                                                          

9
100% WHOLE WHEAT HOAGIE BUNS 

(12 COUNT)
NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

10
LUNCHEON (SLIDER ROLLS-FULLY BAKED 24 

CT) SLICED
10029120 24-pack 5

3.65$                       3.60$                                                                          

11 K-12 SPEC, DINNER ROLL 95933450 24-pack 5 3.65$                       3.60$                                                                          

12 K-12 SPEC, HOAGIE, SLICED 95933440 24-pack 1 5.50$                       5.50$                                                                          

28.59$                     28.30$                                                                        (Rolls) Group II Total:

 Rolls - Group II
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Line No. Description Product No. Packaging
Minimum 

Quantity
Price Negotiated Pricing

1
15 OZ. HAMBURGER BUNS – 100% WHOLE 

WHEAT (8-COUNT)
10222670 8-pack 9

2.68$                       2.65$                                                                          

2 HAMBURGER SEEDED  4" (12 PACK) NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

3
51% WHOLE GRAIN HAMBURGER BUNS 4”          

(30 COUNT)
13730810 30-pack 1

5.88$                       5.86$                                                                          

4 HAMBURGER (WHITE) 4" 30CT 10027600 30-pack 1 5.88$                       5.86$                                                                          

5
100% WHOLE WHEAT HAMBURGER BUNS         

(30 COUNT)
10024580 30-pack 1

5.88$                       5.86$                                                                          

6 15 OZ. ONION SANDWICH BUN 4” (8 COUNT) NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

7 SANDWICH 4” (12 PACK) NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

8
SUB ROLL WHEAT 6” UNSLICED –                          

(6-COUNT) NO BID NO BID NO BID
-$                        -$                                                                           

9
HOT DOG, FOOT-LONG, SIDE-SLICE, 6”                     

(8-COUNT)
10027620 10" 6-count 8

2.75$                       2.73$                                                                          

10
13 OZ. HOT DOG, BUNS – 100% WHOLE WHEAT 

SIDE-SLICED, 6”, (8-COUNT)
NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

11 HOT DOG, SIDE SLICED, 6” (16 PACK) 10027480 16-pack 6 3.50$                       3.50$                                                                          

12 HOT DOG SIDE SLICED, 6" (12 COUNT) NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

13
51% WHOLE GRAIN HOT DOG BUNS 6”            

(16 COUNT)
13709190 16-pack 6

3.50$                       3.50$                                                                          

14
100% WHOLE WHEAT HOTDOG BUNS  6”              

(16 COUNT)
NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

15 ENGLISH MUFFIN, WHITE & WHEAT (6-PK)
64471770    

64471780
6-pack 12

3.80$                       3.76$                                                                          

16 K-12 SPEC 4" HAMBURGER BUNS 95933380 30-pack 1 5.88$                       5.85$                                                                          

17 K-12 SPEC 4" HOTDOG BUNS 95933440 6'bun - 16-pack 6 3.50$                       3.50$                                                                          

43.25$                     43.07$                                                                        (Buns) Group III Total:

Buns - Group III
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Line No. Description Product No. Packaging
Minimum 

Quantity
Price Negotiated Pricing

1 BAGELS, PLAIN, SLICED, (6-COUNT) 64499790 5-count 8 4.10$                       4.05$                                                                          

2
BAGELS, MIXED SEED, SLICED,                                   

(6-COUNT)
64499730 5-count 8

4.10$                       4.05$                                                                          

3
BAGELS, BLUEBERRY, SLICED                                    

(6-COUNT)
64471710

multi-berrry;                   

5-count
8

4.10$                       4.05$                                                                          

4 BAGELS, CINNAMON RAISIN, SLICED 64499740 5-count 8 4.10$                       4.05$                                                                          

16.40$                     16.20$                                                                        

Line No. Description Product No. Packaging
Minimum 

Quantity
Price Negotiated Pricing

1 TASTYKAKES - ASSORTED 687-xxxx-0 assorted packaging assorted 0.98$                       0.97$                                                                          

2
MI CASA 7” 28 OZ FLOUR TORTILLAS (20-

COUNT)
NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

3 MI CASA LOCA 8" FLOUR TORTILLA, 9OZ. NO BID NO BID NO BID -$                        -$                                                                           

0.98$                       0.97$                                                                          (Specialty Product Selection) Group V Total:

(Bagels) Group IV Total:

Bagels - Group IV

Specialty Product Selection - Group V

Prepared by E.Andrew 07.08.21; Revised 07.13.21 Page 4 of  4


